
 

Exp. Com. Ins. LoadersUnloaders RainShine (. USD)

Location Ohio
https://www.genclassifieds.com/x-440366-z

  Exp. Com. Ins. Loaders/Unloaders
  Loaders/Unloaders

  Rain/Shine-We are There For You

  E & C Best Moving Rates Guaranteed

  Experience commercially insured movers (1 million dollars per helper)
  Clean cut uniformed movers Drug and/or alcohol free Background checked

  Professional equipment provided:

  4 assorted dollies 50 clean moving blankets (washed as needed) tool/power tools approx. 50 assorted
tie downs big and small ones /professional ratchet straps

  Save big by getting your own truck!

  Other services offered include any:

  homes ,

  apartments ,

  lofts and studios ,

  basement ,

  garage ,

  house pods ,and storage

  units clean-outs.
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  Save big by getting your own truck!

  Specials on our Rates:

  We take pride for the services we provide, and just like a good friend, we have your back!

  We now offer packing services. Please call us for more information. You have to purchase the packing
materials. We have an excellent, 100% show-up rating for all our jobs.
  Save big by getting your own truck! Specials on Rates ((Cleveland and surroundings))

  We are reliable professionals with over 10 years of experience. We listen to our customers and work
with them to address their needs through there moving solutions.

  We understand how hard moving can be and your feelings during this stressful time. There are so many
characteristics involved in a move.

  Where to start?
  How to pack?
  When to begin?

  All of these doubts and questions are normal when moving but why stress about it?
  Ohio Loyal Movers is here to make your move easy from start to finish!

  Are Movers know very well where to start and how. When you call our moving company, one of our
certified moving consultants will discuss and make sure to get all information needed from you to
formalize a quote. Once a estimate is made, our representative will book an in house consultation to
guarantee you an accurate quote free of surprise charges on moving day. On the day of your move, our
team of movers will get the job done your way in a timely fashion and will not leave until you're satisfied
Services.
  E & C Movers we can provide it. With an experienced staff working around the clock, you can be sure
we will get the job done and get it done right.

  Contact us now!

  Specials on our Rates: For any questions or concerns, please
  Call

  E-mail: wegotmovers4you @ yahoo. com (no spaces)
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 Lots of great references.

 NOV.1,2014
 E and C Movers of Brunswick Awesome
 : Let me share with you how pleased my wife Lisa and I are with your service. Moving from Parma after
almost 12 years left me wondering where did all this stuff come from? We had loaded the 26 foot rental
truck 2 times and unloaded most of that into our new garage. We had a notion we we under water and in
need of help on this third load.Ãƒâ€šÃ‚Â We managed to reach E and C Movers after seeing your name
on Google. This was after 6:00 PM on Saturday November 1, 2014. You promised guys would be there,
in Lyndhurst, to our truck, which we loaded, within a few hours. After seeing how full the truck and garage
were, I was eager for help. So was my son Zach. He tried his best, but with cancer back, out of remission,
he is not as able as he would like. I had to be in my car and headed back to seminary in Lancaster, PA.
where I am studying to be a pastor by 9:00 AM Sunday Morning.Ãƒâ€šÃ‚Â Wayne, it is not too strong to
say, God was there when we found you on Google and with each and every respectful movement of Rich
and Tim the men you sent us. They treated our "stuff" with the utmost care and box after box and even
our 8 foot long picnic table is exactly where we wanted it in the backyard through a fence. Our boxer dog
Edward was very grateful since he likes to stand on it. The next morning, as I let him out before I left for
Pennsylvania, he walked up and sniffed it many times. He seemed to finally get that this was now home. I
told the guys it was our desire to park our cars in the garage that night. They had the truck and our
garage to work through. As they finished there was such a sense of relief that came over our family. I was
deeply grateful for our good fortune in connecting with E and C Movers.Ãƒâ€šÃ‚Â My hope was to offer
this to Angie's List, however, I found no way without getting a membership. If anyone has a need of
moving things and they need help for any reason do not hesitate to call Wayne at E and C Movers. As I
was placing the weights into the grandfather clock the guys stopped and listened to the chime. They
deservedly took pride in knowing they put that clock in the foyer. All the best Luck to you Wayne, Rich
and Tim. I will be posting this on my blog RichardlPryorJr.com . Thank you all.Sincerely,--Richard L. Pryor
Jr.

  E & C Movers on April 30, 2013 they have done quite a few jobs for me, all with great professionalism
and integrity. They moved heavy boxes containing 400 square feet of tile and closet storage units. They
removed and disposed of a queen mattress set for me. Then I had a new King size Tempurpedic
mattress arrive that I couldn't fit upstairs, but E & C came in and found a way to get the job done. They
moved a King bed set as well for me. I plan on using E & C Movers again.

  Adam B
  Supervisor/OTP3

  TriArch.Inc-Andy Payne
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  I used E & C Movers to move from an apartment to a condo in March, 2013. The movers were
professional and efficient. I bought a 500lb vanity and a two person tub with an 80 gallon hot water tank.
The movers brought it all upstairs to my master bath without issue! I needed help with some demo and
some major demo clean up (about 60 construction bags worth). Movers came in, bagged it up and helped
haul it out in a matter of a few hours. Awesome work! I would use them to move again.

  Adam B

  Wayne,

  Thank you very much for the smooth, and uneventful move. E&C movers (wayne, and his fellow
colleague John) arrived 30 minutes ready to work. They took excellent care of my possessions, and
packed them more securely than I ever could have. They took rare breaks, and were
  extremely professional. I was leary about hiring movers from
  Craigslist, but after working with professionals, was glad I did so.
  You wont be disappointed when hiring Wayne. Thank you very much for
  your help

  Rob

  Wayne and his crew are excellent movers. They both packed my UHaul when I moved from Cleveland
to Chicago AND unpacked it when I moved back. They loaded the truck quickly and securely even though
I had some heavy and awkward pieces being moved from the 2nd floor.

  They also unloaded the truck in record time even though they had to do it all by hand since the utility
dolly provided by UHaul was busted AND I asked them to move my possessions into two different
adjacent houses! Prompt, courteous, experienced and professional. No job seems to be too big or too
small for this crew. And their rates are extremely reasonable too. Lain

  Hey Wayne,

  "I contacted Wayne at E and C Movers for help unloading a Uhaul; he and his helper were on time the
following morning, and were professional and courteous during the move. I'd recommend Wayne to
anyone that needs help moving in or moving out."

  Thanks, Veez

  Dear Wayne,

                               4 / 5



 

  Thank you very much for helping me move from Cleveland to St. Louis. The truck was packed
beautifully and nothing was even the slightest bit damaged on arrival despite the 10 hour drive on mostly
smooth but occasionally bumpy highways. The unloaders even commented on how well the truck had
been packed. Thank you again and feel free to give my contact info to anyone looking for a reference for
you.

  Take care, Baseer

  Wayne and his team member did a great job moving us from middleburg heights to twinsburg city. They
were fast, efficient, and most of all honest. Wayne runs a great business helping people move and not
ripping them off like the big companies do.I would recommend his company any day to all my friends and
family.

  Herky Feroz

  Good evening,

  Wayne I just wanted to take the opportunity to express my thanks for a job well done, above and beyond
my expectations. On the most snowy day in the middleof winter,youhelpedme move my belongings in a
timely manner, and saved me money in the process. When I wanted to give up, your company
persevered. I would use your services again if needed and definitely recommendyouto anyonein need of
prompt, efficient and innovative movers. Thank you, Adrianne

  Hi Wayne,

  Just wanted to tell you how much I appreciate all your efforts in trying to move the swingset I bought for
my granddaughter. I've never seen such an industrious, hard-working pair as you two and your sense of
humor made the ordeal of trying to move the swingset a pleasure. I appreciate your advise not to move
the set after all because of its dangerously rotted condition. After spending a couple of hours with you, I
completely trust your judgment and knew that you had my granddaughters best interest in mind even
though you would not get paid for the full job. I would rehire you both in a heartbeat. Sorry the project
turned into such a fiasco. When the key broke off in the Penske truck ignition, I guess that was a sign the
swingset was not meant to be. Thanks again and I look forward to working with you on the next crazy
project I come up with. Best. Lorra

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

                               5 / 5

http://www.tcpdf.org

