
 

2014 Chrysler 300 (21000, USD)

Location Iowa
https://www.genclassifieds.com/x-567379-z

  2014 CHRYSLER 300Call INTERNET SALES at (402) 403-6641 ext
307http://ToddArcherHyundai.cleancarsorg.com/v/20174178/2/11396815/307Todd Archer Hyundai
$21,000DESCRIPTION:One Owner with Active Warranty!! Clean Carfax & Title Fully Inspected Oil
Changed & New Cabin Filter!! Ride is even-tempered. Previous owner purchased it brand new! Want to
save some money? Get the NEW look for the used price on this one owner vehicle. Let Us Know if You
Have any Questions? Our Store number is 402-905-2277! Enjoy the Pictures & Your Stay on Our Site!!
Featuring forward momentum powered by traditional values our exquisite 2014 Chrysler 300 dressed to
impress in Bright White Clear Coat embodies upscale styling and refined taste. Under the sleek hood is a
standard 3.6 Liter Pentastar V6 with its 8 Speed automatic transmission producing up to 292 hp with an
efficiency of 31 mpg on the open road. This sedan simply glides down the highway indulging its
passengers at every turn. The aerodynamically designed raked-back windshield and forward-leaning
fascia provide a sophisticated yet aggressive stance with tailored finishes of the iconic grille and LED
headlamps exuding an attitude unlike any other. The interior of the 300 is loaded with luxuries that you
deserve such as automatic headlights heated mirrors keyless entry/ignition and dual-zone climate control.
Relax in power adjustable leather heated seats and enjoy the technology of a central touchscreen
interface Bluetooth phone and audio connectivity and a 6 speaker sound system with iPod/USB
connectivity and satellite radio. Of course mile after mile you'll experience enhanced safety and security
with anti-lock brakes traction and stability control front side airbags side curtain airbags a driver knee
airbag and active front head restraints. With power and luxury on your side you'll be looking for reasons to
get out and drive. Print this page and call us Now... We Know You Will Enjoy Your Test Drive Towards
Ownership!DETAILS:Condition: UsedMileage: 32,700Engine: 3.6L V6Transmission: Automatic
8-SpeedExterior Color: WhiteInterior Color: BlackStock #: 83416AVIN #:
2C3CCAAG9EH150976OPTIONS:292 hp horsepower3.6 liter V6 DOHC engine4 Doors4-wheel ABS
brakes8-way power adjustable drivers seatAir conditioning with dual zone climate controlAlloy
WheelsAudio controls on steering wheelAutomatic TransmissionAuxiliary InputBack Up CameraBluetooth
ReadyCD playerCenter Console - Full with covered storageChrome grillClimate controlled - Driver and
passenger heated-cushion driver and passenger heated-seatbackClock - AnalogCompassDaytime
running lightsDusk sensing headlightsEngine hour meterExternal temperature displayFolding Rear bench
seatsFront seat type - BucketFuel economy EPA highway (mpg): 31 and EPA city (mpg): 19Head airbags
- Curtain 1st and 2nd rowHeated drivers seatHeated passenger seatHome Garage RemoteInterior air
filtrationIntermittent window wipersKeyless Ignition - Doors and ignitionKnee airbags - DriverLeather
SeatsMulti-function remote - Trunk/hatch/door/tailgateOverhead console - Mini with storagePassenger
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AirbagPower heated mirrorsPower Passenger SeatPower windows with 2 one-touchPrivacy/tinted
glassRear defoggerRear-wheel driveRemote power door locksSatellite Radio ReadySpeed sensitive
window wipersSpeed-proportional power steeringStability controlTachometerTilt and telescopic steering
wheelTraction control - ABS and drivelineTransmission hill holderTrip computerUSB PortVideo Monitor
Location - Front2014 CHRYSLER 300Call INTERNET SALES at (402) 403-6641ext 307
http://ToddArcherHyundai.cleancarsorg.com/v/20174178/2/11396815/307$21
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