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1100 Wilshire is a high-rise building with sophistication and elegance. It offers luxury condos from the
17th floor to the 37th floor. The condos have luxurious amenities such as granite, stainless steel and floor
to ceiling corner views. Residents can enjoy the city view because the building features 360 degree
unobstructed views. This building also has 24-hour security and 12 levels of parking. The 17th floor of
1100 Wilshire features an open air deck with a heated pool, cabanas, fire pit and grill offering an outdoor
space for residents to relax, exercise and entertain friends.The condos have a generous layout with a
modern color palette. Ceiling heights range from 10 Ã‚Â½ feet in most lofts to 23 feet. Some units are
two stories and some have private balconies.1100 Wilshire is an exciting building with sophistication and
great views because this blue glass triangle building stands unobstructed. It is five star luxurious living in
the Central City West District of Downtown Los Angeles.

 @@@@@@@@@@@@@@ Furniture To Love @@@@@@@@@@@@@@@@@
 The "Cottage Retreat" youth bedroom collection takes early American country design to create a fun and
inviting cottage retreat perfect for any child's bedroom. The replicated light cream paint with subtle
replicated brushing flows over the graphic leaf design patterns and bead board panel accents create a
relaxing atmosphere that is sure to make any child feel at home. Create the special kid's bedroom with
the refreshing design of the "Cottage Retreat" youth bedroom collection.

 Color: Cream Cottage
 Material: Wood Products and Other
 granite
 quartz
 tile
 marble
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 slate
 backsplash
 countertops
 cabinets
 @@@@@@@@@@@@@@@@@@===============================@@@@@@@@@
@@@@@@@@@@@@@@@@@@22

Watch Dolphins . beautiful sunsets, regattas, Coronado island from your own condo! Gorgeous Ocean
front Condo Aqua Residential complex Weather resistant materials Optic Fiber Internet (very few in
town)Built-in BBQ in side terrace 16 units tower Foyer Huge spaces 3BR 3Bth TV room 24 hrs security
guards Pool Jacuzzi Main bathroom totally renovated with wood, quartz and stone applications, Spanish
tile flooring that leads to the walk-in closet Bathtub Front and back terraces great for parties Professional
interior designer advise 2 parking spaces indoor Built-in sectional at front terrace big enough to fit 12
people overlooking the beach Gym Elevator in house Washer and dryer Private access to the beach
Oceanfront A piece of heaven!!!Located in Baja 10 minutes from the San Diego border Make appt
now!$530,000 USD

For sale 10 acres in beautiful Butte Valley, the hidden gem of the Shasta area in Siskiyou County. 45
minutes from Mt Shasta. From Hwy 5 take Hwy 97 to Meiss Lake Road and turn left. Drive through the
pine forests past Butte Valley Wildlife Area -- to the paved road. The lot is 327' wide by 1328' deep. The
first 700 feet is flat (228,900 square feet) with the back of the lot sloping up to a forestry road. The lot is
on a paved road and there is power available at the street. In the winter this is one of the only areas
where the roads will be plowed for snow so you will always have access to town. We love this area! The
only reason we are selling is we want to purchase a larger lot down the street. If you want to "get away
from it all" this is the place for you. The stars are beautiful at night and all you hear are. . ... well actually
you don't really hear anything but nature. The area is surrounded by Klamath National Forest with plenty
of forestry roads for exploring. This is a perfect place for a vacation home or for camping with an RV.
$24,900
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